NEW YORK STATE
DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH
TABULATION OF PROPOSALS (IFBs)

PROPOSAL/PROJECT TITLE: New York State Over the Counter Covid-19 Test Supply ( #20211)
BIDS OPENED DATE: 8/3/2022  TIME: 12:30 PM ET

PLACE: Virtually PRESENT WERE: Sue Mantica and Eryn Keefe

1. Bids received by the specified bid due date, August 2, 2022, and time, 4:00 PM ET:

Bid # Vendor Name Dollar Value of Bid
(List bids in

numeric order

with lowest

bidder as #1)

1 Victory International Group $1.64

2 COO Verepass $1.80

3 BCALIFORNIA $2.35

4 Remcoda $2.35

5 Creative Concepts Manufacturing Group | $2.50

* See attached for additional bids received

2. Bids received after due date that were returned to vendor unopened:

Rover Labs Aero Healthcare
Wellstand Health ProPhase Labs
Freight N Cargo Logistics Inc Optima Consulting Group

3. List names of vendors who notified DOH of intent not to bid:

Laboratory Products Sales, Inc

Ellume’s

This is to certify that 38 firms were invited to bid and 122 were received. | certify that | publicly opened these
bids at the time and place specified and that all the bids received are recorded above.*

Signature: Date: August 3, 2022
Print Name:  Sue Mantica Title: Bureau Director




Bid #

(List bids in numeric

order with lowest

Vendor Name

Dollar Value of Bid

bidder as #1)

1 | Victory International Group $ 1.64

2 | COO Verepass $ 1.80

3 | BCALIFORNIA LLC $ 2.35

4 | Remcoda $ 2.35

5 | Creative Concepts Manufacturing Group $ 2.50

6 | Mega Company $ 2.69

7 | WatMIND USA $ 2.75

8 | WOMA Health $ 2.798

9 | WOMA Health $ 2.798
10 | ProPhase Labs $ 2.7998
11 | Salsa Industrial Supply $ 2.89
12 | Salsa Industrial Supply $ 2.89
13 | Mediswiss $ 2.95
14 | YK Industries Inc. $ 2.95
15 | Celltrion, Inc $ 2.98
16 | Stronghold Trading, LLC $ 3.00
17 | SanitizeNow Inc. $ 3.11
18 | 2 San LLC $ 3.13
19 | Market Makeover LLC $ 3.17
20 | LumiQuick Diagnostics, Inc. $ 3.20
21 | ANP Technologies, Inc. $ 3.25
22 | PSG $ 3.50
23 | Safe Health Systems, Inc. $ 3.50
24 | Healthy School Supply, LLC $ 3.66
25 | Market Makeover LLC $ 3.74
26 | Stuart Brown, VP & GM at Quantgene, Inc. $ 3.75
27 | BaRupOn LLC $ 3.79
28 | medsup $ 3.96
29 | Santé Group $ 4.16




Bid #

(List bids in numeric

order with lowest

Vendor Name

Dollar Value of Bid

bidder as #1)
30 | Kameo Health $ 4.25
31 | Visit Health $ 4.27
32 | BaRupOn LLC $ 4.44
33 | Phoenix Contracting LLC $ 4.45
34 | Rover Labs $ 4.48
35 | Astor Pharmaceuticals LLC $ 4.50
36 | BYRINC $ 4.58
37 | Drug Guild Distributors, Inc. $ 4.60
38 | Market Makeover LLC $ 4.74
39 | Gothams $ 4.80
40 | Empire Dental Supplies, Inc $ 4.88
41 | OnGo $ 4.98
42 | Elevation health group $ 5.00
43 | Elevation health group $ 5.00
44 | Nerfherder Distribution, LLC $ 5.18
45 | Uweport, LLC $ 5.20
46 | iHealth Labs Inc. $ 5.30
47 | Adaptiv Biomed $ 5.36
48 | Med Safety Supply LLC $ 5.40
49 | SZY Holdings LLC $ 5.50
50 | Digital Gagets $ 5.50
51 | Medea Inc. $ 5.78
52 | Phoenix Contracting LLC $ 5.85
53 | Wellness Coaches USA, LLC $ 5.90
54 | BaRupOn LLC $ 5.95
55 | Projects Bio Shield $ 5.98
56 | USA Medical Supply $ 5.98
57 | True Vision & RKL Suppliers $ 6.00
58 | Siemens Healthineers $ 6.00




Bid #

(List bids in numeric

order with lowest

Vendor Name

Dollar Value of Bid

bidder as #1)
59 | Spectrum Medical, Inc $ 6.48
60 | AlphaProMed LLC $ 6.49
61 | Empire Medical & Dental Supplies $ 6.56
62 | Drug Guild Distributors, Inc $ 6.58
63 | Empire Dental Supplies, Inc $ 6.60
64 | AnyPlace MD $ 6.70
65 | BT Supplies West Inc. $ 6.72
66 | BT Supplies West Inc. $ 6.72
67 | DemeTECH Corporation $ 6.85
68 | InBios International, Inc. $ 6.90
69 | Wellstand $ 6.97
70 | OnGo $ 6.98
71 | OnGo $ 6.98
72 | Thomas Scientific, LLC $ 6.98
73 | Elevation health group $ 7.00
74 | Elevation health group $ 7.00
75 | Elevation health group $ 7.00
76 | Elevation health group $ 7.00
77 | 360 Health Services, LLC $ 7.00
78 | DemeTECH Corporation $ 7.49
79 | Laboratory Products Sales, Inc $ 7.50
80 | Mersi Distribution LLC's $ 7.60
81 | Projects Bio Shield $ 7.70
82 | Wellstand $ 7.75
83 | Maclean Health $ 7.85
84 | Spartan Medical, Inc $ 7.99
85 | AnyPlace MD $ 8.10
86 | AnyPlace MD $ 8.10
87 | MaximBio $ 8.28




Bid #

(List bids in numeric

order with lowest

Vendor Name

Dollar Value of Bid

bidder as #1)
88 | PRO1TEK $ 8.37
89 | Mercedes Scientific $ 8.50
90 | Lochness Medical Supplies Inc $ 8.64
91 | Med-Part $ 8.74
92 | AURAI Capital LLC $ 8.74
93 | Innovative Genomics LLC $ 9.00
94 | OraSure $ 9.04
95 | NYSPSP $ 9.40
96 | AURAI Capital LLC $ 10.45
97 | Allstate Medical $ 10.50
98 | Quidel $ 11.44
99 | 24 Ventures, LLC $ 11.50
100 | Zaymat Distributors $ 12.00
101 | Amaylootcapital $ 12.00
102 | Orchard $ 12.00
103 | Supply Line International Medical LLC $ 12.00
104 | Amaylootcapital $ 14.75
105 | Orchard $ 14.75
106 | Supply Line International Medical LLC $ 14.75
107 | Abbott $ 16.00
108 | Roche Diagnostics Corporation $ 16.00
109 | 24 Ventures, LLC $ 16.00
110 | Optima Consulting Group $ 16.45
111 | AnyPlace MD $ 16.50
112 | Div Med Inc. $ 17.00
113 | Allstate Medical $ 17.25
114 | Sanitex Global $ 23.79
115 | NYSPSP $ 31.35




Bid #

(List bids in numeric

order with lowest

Vendor Name

Dollar Value of Bid

bidder as #1)
116 | Wellhealth's Bid Form Blank
117 | Phoenix Contracting LLC No Bid price provided
118 | Phoenix Contracting LLC No Bid price provided
119 | Phoenix Contracting LLC No Bid price provided
120 | 360 Health Services, LLC No Bid price provided




